CALIFORNIA

CITY OF ARTS &
FLOWERS

Recap for RFQ #2640 —
Miscellaneous Electric

One Independent
B Source Electric I sl
115-9311 $4.17/ea $4.00/ea
Stud, Post Insulator, 34" x 7-1/2" w/ flat washer, Order Qt . Order Qt
200 Porcelain Products #6512, Joslyn #J25250.1, Cooper $9.94/ea mEJst be 17)5/ No Bid (must be iz
DF19M4 or 210) multiples of 35)
115-9605 . . .
100 Strap, Pipe, 1", Stainless Steel, 2-Hole No Bid $380.00 No Bid No Bid
117-0055
500 Bolt, Carriage, 3/8” x 4-1/2" Hot Dipped Galvanized, $285.00 $300.00 No Bid $285.00
Joslyn #J8634- %"
117-0106
200 Bolt, Machine, 5/8” x 6", Hot Dipped Galvanized, with $186.00 $194.00 No Bid $190.00
nut, MCED #DF386, Chance #8806, Joslyn #J8806
117-0112
Bolt, Machine, 5/8” x 12", Hot Dipped Galvanized, .
200 | i’ nut. MOED #DF3512, Chance #8812, Joslyn $238.00 $238.00 No Bid Se2uioy
#J8812
117-0114
Bolt, Machine, 5/8”" x 14", Hot Dipped Galvanized, .
200 | i’ nut. MOED #DF3814, Chance #8514, Joslyn deaciod $256.00 No Bid $260.00
#J8814
117-0320
Bolt, D.A., 5/8" x 20", Hot Dipped Galvanized, with .
100 | ot Fuil Thread, MCED #DR2D20, Chance #3870, 20l ATV No Bid $265.00
Joslyn #38870
117-0322
Bolt, D.A., 5/8" x 22", Hot Dipped Galvanized, with .
150 nut, full thread, MCED #DF2pr22, Chance #8872, $426.00 $397.50 No Bid $420.00
Joslyn #J8872
117-0604
500 Bolt, Lag, ¥2” x 4", Hot Dipped Galvanized, Joslyn $280.00 $265.00 No Bid $325.00
#J8754P
117-0875
Washer, Round, Hot Dipped Galvanized for 34" Bolt, $0.30/ea . $0.33/ea
200 for use w/ crossarm pin2p12 KV or higher, 2" x 5/32” x LGt (min 500) No Bid (min 500)
13/16" hole diameter, P/N DF1W4,
117-0880
200 Washer, Tapped Lip, 2" w/ 5/8” Hole, for use with $276.00 $228.00 No Bid $230.00
crossarm pins 12 KV or higher, Hughes #LW6DT
117-0950
400 Washer, Galvanized for Street lights, 2" Diameter, 1” No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hole
117-1130
500 Deadend Service Grip, #4 Aluminum, Helical $295.00 $305.00 No Bid $290.00
#HSG514, Preformed #SG4502
117-1503 . .
100 | Connector, Insulink, 1/0 — 1/0 Str, PU #PIK-00 No Bid 00 No Bid $58.00
117-1507
200 Connector, Insulink, 2-4 Str, PU #PIK-12, Burndy No Bid $70.00 No Bid $68.00

#ES2R2W




200

117-1508
Connector, Insulink, 4-4 Str, PU #PIK-22

No Bid

$70.00

No Bid

$68.00

50

117-2010
Tape, Coding, %" x 66’, Red, Scotch 3-M #35, No
Subs!!

$162.00

$159.50

$162.50

$149.00

100

117-2602
Connector, Squeezeon, 4/0 to 6-2, Burndy #YHD 250

$60.00

$67.70

No Bid

$61.00

50

118-0515
Shoe, 3/0 556 ACSR, Swingaway, Aluminum Straight
Line, Fargo #GD-965A

$1,649.00

$1,639.50

No Bid

$1,552.50

150

118-0810
Clamp, CU Hot Line Tap, 2/0, #8 Solid, Fargo GH-100
or Chance #S51520CC

$1,177.50

$1,158.00

No Bid

$1,107.00

25

118-0922
Clamp, Single Tap, 6 SOL — 4/0 Main 39, Blackburn
#PGH-4 — NO GREASE!!

No Bid

$512.75

No Bid

$608.75

50

118-2009
Sleeve, Tension, 336.4 Aluminum, Burndy
#YDS301AT

No Bid

$328.50

No Bid

$459.50

96

118-2991

Cutout, 25 KV, Open, 100A, Polymer, 48/ea per pallet,
Accepts removable head fuse only, S&C #890-
52R10-P-BD

No Bid

$14,904.00
OR

$9,288
(Cooper)

No Bid

$13,610.88

144

118-9918
Meter Socket Disconnect Sleeve, Meter Devices
Company #MD-5

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3,077.28

50

124-3114
Cable Grip, 1-1/2" to 1-3/4", Kellems #022-01-019 or
Economy #SPC-150-SO

$1,493.50

$1,333.00

No Bid

Kellems
$1,436.50
Or Lewis
$1,012.50

15

124-6063

Terminator, Single Piece, 2 Str, 25 KV for .780
Insulation Diameter, 15 KV Cable, Elastimold 16 THG-
FG-0220-4

No Bid

$599.25

No Bid

$537.00

15

124-6068

Terminator, Single Piece, 2/0 Str, 25 KV for .910
Insulation Diameter, 15 KV Cable, Elastimold 16 THG-
GA-0250-4

No Bid

$680.10

No Bid

$605.40

100

124-6320

Elbow, Loadbreak, #2 Str, 15 KV for .760 Insulation
Diameter, 8.3/14.4 KV Class 200 Amp, Blackburn
#JT2BE2BAT, RTE #2604600B45MA, Cooper
#LE215B04T

$3,487.00

$2,385.00

No Bid

$2,410.00

75

124-6490
Cap, Insulated, 200 Amp, with drain wire, Elastimold
#160DRG

No Bid

$1,469.25

No Bid

$1,470.00

75

124-6702

Tee Body Kit, 500 KCM, 600 Amp, w/ Cap for 500
KCM 15 KV Cable, Complete Kit, Cooper
#TP615G22C

$24,615.00

$22,692.00

No Bid

$22,331.25

30

124-6709
Grease, Silicone, for Rubber Products, GE #623, 5.3
Oz Tube

No Bid

$230.70

No Bid

No Bid

120

151-0186
Lamp, HPS, 150 Watt, 55V, LU-150, Mogul Base, 20
per case

$1,026.00

$948.00

$948.00

$804.00

80

151-0190
Lamp, HPS, 250 Watt, 55Volt, LU-250, Mogul Base,
20 per case

$792.00

$680.00

$716.00

$564.80
(for 84 pcs)

50

151-7047

Starter, 35-400 Watt for 52V-55V HPS, 35W-150W w/
Jumper or 90V-100V, HPS Lamp 70W-400W w/
Jumper Removed, Replacer Ignitor #GE35-967410-51
— No Subs!

$1,576.50

$1,573.00

$1,700.00

$1,750.00




